
A fundamental human 
right is easy and afford-
able access to good health-
care. Yet many people who 
live in underserved neigh-
borhoods face healthcare 
barriers. They include a 
lack of neighborhood clin-
ics and healthcare provid-
ers, healthcare cost/insur-
ance coverage issues, and 
transportation challenges. 
Equal access to health-
care is important because 
it reduces preventable 
diseases, improves health 
outcomes, and creates 
stronger neighborhoods. 

Fortunately, there’s com-
munity-based support 
to breaking down these 
barriers. Carlos T. Carter, 
President & CEO of the 
Urban League of Greater 
Pittsburgh, highlights the 
UL’s role in helping peo-
ple get the good care they 
need — and deserve.  

Q: Carlos, thanks for 
checking in with us. 
What kinds of pro-
grams does the Urban 
League offer that help 
people focus on im-
proving their health?

Carlos T. Carter: We pro-

vide a variety of programs 
aimed at enhancing 
health and well-being in 
the community. Our Fam-
ily Support Centers nur-
ture children, strengthen 
families, and contribute to 
building resilient commu-
nities. 

We also offer programs 
focused on self-improve-
ment, such as our Ur-
ban Tech Jobs program, 
which features 16 weeks 
of hybrid (virtual and 
in-person) evening class-
es. These classes provide 
prospective students with 

opportunities for econom-
ic advancement that are 
closely linked to better 
health outcomes. 

By integrating educa-
tion, access to resources, 
and community support, 
the Urban League is 
committed to fostering a 
healthier and more equi-
table community for all.

Q: That sounds like 
a comprehensive ap-
proach! There’s a 
well-deserved mistrust 
of the healthcare sys-
tem in the Black com-
munity.   How does the 

Urban League help 
people make connec-
tions with and navigate 
within our region’s 
healthcare system? 

Carlos T. Carter: We do it 

through our Family Sup-
port Centers. The centers 
serve as a bridge that con-
nects families to essential 
services and community 
health clinics that provide 
quality care. 

We also assist with so-
cial services like trans-
portation to medical ap-
pointments, which is one 
of the key barriers to eq-
uitable healthcare access. 
By combining education, 
direct support, and com-
munity resources, the Ur-
ban League is committed 
to building trust and im-
proving health outcomes 
for our community mem-
bers.
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Equal access to healthcare

Helping kids and families find the best 
path to good and fair healthcare outcomes 

Achieving health equity 
means making sure every-
one gets the resources and 
care they need to reach 
their best physical and 
mental health. Striving to 
connect people with these 
resources and care is im-
portant. 

This is especially true in 
communities where un-
der-investment in things 
like schools, parks, public 
transportation, and inter-
net access can create barri-
ers and limit access to care. 
Because these barriers are 
experienced unequally, the 
people who need care the 
most have the hardest time 

getting it. 
Ideally, health equity be-

gins with every child re-
ceiving the resources and 
care they need from the 
moment they’re born. But 
in underserved communi-
ties, children, too, encoun-
ter complicated obstacles. 

In our region, pediatric 
researchers are studying 
healthcare systems and 

the families that use them. 
That includes identifying, 
understanding, and re-
moving intentional and 
unintentional barriers. The 
goal is to create healthcare 
systems that offer more op-
tions, more flexibility, and 
greater equity. 

One of those research-
ers is University of Pitts-
burgh’s Dr. Kristin Ray, 
Associate Professor of Pe-
diatrics and Director of 
Health Systems Improve-
ment at UPMC Children’s 
Community Pediatrics. 
Dr. Ray and her team are 
working to address social 
determinants of health 

(SDoH) by changing and 
improving how healthcare 
is delivered to their pediat-
ric patients. 

According to the CDC, 
SDoH are the conditions 
in which people are born, 
grow, live, work, and age. 
These conditions impact 
people’s physical and men-
tal health and include 
things like housing, job op-

portunities, health care, in-
come, education, and social 
support. 

“Healthcare delivery in-
cludes both people and 
systems,” Dr. Ray explains. 
“Our work focuses on un-
derstanding and incor-
porating patients’ lived 
experiences. We use that in-
formation to help us design 
systems that make it easi-
er for them to receive care 
that’s affordable, inclusive, 
and within reach — in-per-
son and online.”

One of the newest parts 
of healthcare delivery sys-
tems, for example, is tele-
medicine, which exploded 

during the pandemic. On 
the surface, telemedicine 
appears to be a great solu-
tion for people who have 
a hard time getting their 
child to a doctor due to the 
cost, time, and complexity 
of taking a bus or car. 

However, scratch the sur-
face and you’ll find access 
issues with telemedicine, 
too. Dr. Ray explains. “Does 

a parent or caregiver have a 
smartphone or tablet with 
a reliable way to charge it? 
Is their Wi-Fi dependable? 
Do they have a quiet, safe 
space where they can con-
nect for the telemedicine 
visit? Can they download 
and use the telemedicine 
app? Does the app work 
in the language the family 
speaks? ” 

With all these factors to 
consider, does telemedi-
cine help to achieve health 
equity or not? Are health 
systems using telemedi-
cine in ways that help fill 
the gaps of getting in-per-
son care? And if not, how 
could it? What other op-
tions are there for people if 
they can’t — or don’t want 
to — use telemedicine? If 
telemedicine improves ac-
cess and quality for some 
people, does it make their 
health outcomes better and 
fairer? What about groups 
it excludes? 

“These are difficult, com-
plicated questions,” says 
Dr. Ray. “But answering 
and addressing them is key 
to reducing ongoing health-
care inequities in our re-
gion.”

Dr. Ray’s research in-

cludes not only delivery 
solutions like telemedicine, 
but also solutions that ad-
dress healthcare barriers 
caused by financial hard-
ship, food insecurity, hous-
ing support, and neighbor-
hood factors. 

Her research begins with 
small, one-on-one inter-
views with patients about 
what’s working with the 
healthcare system they’re 
using and what’s not. Re-
searchers ask about pain 
points and problems with 
the system and encour-
age patients to offer ideas 
about what would make 
the system smoother and 
more just. 

The interviews are fol-
lowed by larger, broader 
surveys. Both methods help 
to shape changes to health-
care delivery systems. 
Sometimes the changes 
are small and local – like 
making a clinic’s telephone 
scheduling system easi-
er to use and understand. 
Sometimes the changes are 
being addressed by clinics 
throughout the country, 
like the best ways to ask 
patients and parents about 
food insecurity and trans-
portation barriers. Or how 
best to support primary 
care doctors and special-
ists when they’re moving 
patients to each other for 
continued care? 

As these types of health-
care system changes are 
created, Dr. Ray stresses 
the importance of evalu-
ating and tweaking them. 
“We need to be mindful of 
the fact that when we make 
changes with the goal of 
allowing people to access 
healthcare in new and dif-
ferent ways, the changes 

may make some problems 
worse or even create new 
problems,” she says. “That’s 
why it’s important to keep a 
close eye on how the chang-
es affect different groups of 
patients and act immedi-
ately to fix problems that 
keep them from getting the 
care they need.”

She continues, “For ex-
ample, with telemedicine, 
we’re now studying how 
people use it and its impact 
on individual and commu-
nity health outcomes. We’re 
also interested in how it’s 
changing the healthcare 
system itself.”

Whether it’s geographic, 
social, economic, or some 
other type of healthcare 
access barrier, the research 
model Dr. Ray uses is based 
on continuous learning. 
“What do our patients need 
and how can the pediatric 
system best support chil-
dren’s health into adult-
hood in a way that’s equita-
ble,” she asks. “The answer 
requires that we ask about, 
listen to, and understand 
our patients’ lives and con-
sider all these factors as 
we shape future research, 
practice, and policies.”

If you or someone you 
know has barriers keeping 
them from getting the care 
they need (transportation, 
health insurance, internet 
or phone access, or health-
care location), contact Unit-
ed Way’s PA 211 Southwest. 
Call 211, visit pa211sw.org, 
or text a ZIP Code to 898-
211 and receive free, pri-
vate help from thousands 
of programs and services in 
your neighborhood that can 
make life better and more 
equitable. 
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Need help with daily needs and emergencies? Turn to 211. 
PA 211 Southwest links 

people in our region with 
health and human services 
via an easy-to-remember 
phone number:  211. Oth-
er connection options in-
clude chat, text or online at 
pa211sw.org. 

Nearly 507,000 reached 
out to 211 last year and 
received referrals to ser-
vices to help  with everyday 
needs, such as:	

Getting a ride to a doctor’s 

appointment.
Accessing a digital con-

nection and navigation for a 
telemedicine visit. 

Getting meals delivered to 
an elder’s apartment.

Scheduling free tax prepa-
ration appointments.

211 also assists when 
there’s an emergency, such 
as:

A mental health crisis.
Financial problems with 

rent, utility bills, or a mort-

gage payment.
Shelter for people experi-

encing domestic violence.
Operated by the United 

Way of Southwestern Penn-
sylvania, PA 211 South-
west receives support from 
Peoples Gas and Duquesne 
Light Company. The orga-
nization maintains a list of 
8,000 human services pro-
viders that accept referrals 
and works with local and 
county governments and 

service providers to make 
sure important information 
is easy to find when people 
need it most.

Each day, trained 211 spe-
cialists, known as resource 
navigators, connect people 
to services, including:

Basic needs like food 
banks, shelters, health in-
surance, low-cost internet, 
and help with rent and util-
ity bills. 211 also schedules 
thousands of free tax prepa-

ration appointments.
Health needs, including 

access to mental health 
crisis help, support groups, 
and counseling.

Job help, such as financial 
aid, job training, and educa-
tion programs.

Support for seniors and 
people with disabilities, in-
cluding home meals, trans-
portation, and health care 
referrals.

Youth programs like af-

ter-school activities, sum-
mer camps, mentoring and 
protection services.

Disaster preparation and 
response.

By calling, 211, visiting 
pa211sw.org, or texting a 
ZIP Code to 898-211, peo-
ple can receive free, private 
help from thousands of 
programs and services in 
their neighborhood that can 
make their lives better and 
more equitable. 


